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"Someone has stolen Santa's bank card!"

Combining the tongue-in-cheek charm of a modern classic with the timeless magic of cherished holiday
tradition, here is a new Christmas story guaranteed to delight children of all ages--including those who
pretend to have not grown up.

At the request of his fans, bestselling novelist Dean Koontz has created a contemporary masterpiece that is
destined to take place alongside "The Night Before Christmas" and Christmas Carol as a perennial Yuletide
favorite.

Santa's Twin is the hilarious and heartwarming story of two little girls, Charlotte and Emily, who set out to
save Santa from his mischievious twin--Bob Claus--who has not only stolen Santa's sleigh, but has stuffed
his toy bag with mud pies, cat poop, and broccoli! Plus, he's threatening to turn Donner, Blitzen and the rest
of the reindeer into soup! And look at the messhe's leaving under the tree!

How the brave but foolhardy sisters fly to the north pole and rescue Santa from his "deeply troubled" twin is
an utterly charming and unforgettable story that will add sparkle to your holiday season.

The first major new Christmas story in decades, Santa's Twin is sure to bring joy that parents can share with
their children. Lavishly illustrated with spectacular paintings by Phil Parks, this thoroughly modern
masterpiece breathes new life and warmth into the world's most beloved legend

Read it aloud, preferably to someone whose laugh you love to hear.

And Merry Christmas!
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Sena:

This book untitled Santa's Twin to be one of several books this best seller in this year, that is because when
you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book
retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
easier to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your
account to past this guide from your list.

Gail Cote:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Santa's Twin book written by well-
known writer whose to say well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still question Santa's Twin as good book not just by the cover but also by the
content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing another
sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have
to listening to one more sixth sense.

Earl Casey:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that
need more time to be learn. Santa's Twin can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you actually
who have those short time problems.

Mark Smith:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Santa's Twin is simple bringing you can
read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have got much space to bring
the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the
particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this
book.
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